Re: Submission Confirmation Request From suryati_luh@yahoo.com

Dari: ARPG Support (infoarpg@gmail.com)
Kepada: suryati_luh@yahoo.com
Tanggal: Minggu, 11 Desember 2022 pukul 00.01 GMT+8

Dear Luh Suriati

Thank you for the submission of your manuscript for publication in our journal. Your manuscript
has been received and assigned the Paper ID as 44456-JAC-2022, please remember to quote
your paper id in all future correspondence. Your manuscript will undergo a review process. As
soon as possible the review report will be sent to your email.

Should you need any assistance please feel free to contact us via email or live chat.

Best Regards,

Support Team ARPG

Academic Research Publishing Group
Academic Research

URL: www.arpgweb.com

Pakistan Office: Rahim Yar Khan, 64200 Punjab, Pakistan
Germany Office: 47 Kasselbergweg 63619 Bad Orb, Germany
Email: editor@arpgweb.com ; info@arpgweb.com

Phone: +92685870320

On Sat, Dec 10, 2022 at 4:38 PM > <suryati_luh@yahoo.com> wrote:
From suryati_luh@yahoo.com

Menue Script Titile: The impact of chitosan at the physical performance of the coffee skin-based edible film
Menu Script Field: Agriculture, food and enviroment

and Contact No.081347411966


http://www.arpgweb.com/
mailto:editor@arpgweb.com
mailto:info@arpgweb.com
mailto:suryati_luh@yahoo.com
mailto:suryati_luh@yahoo.com

Re: Manuscript Conditionally Acceptance Letter: The impact of chitosan at the physical
performance of the coffee skin-based edible film

Dari: Status ARPG (statusarpg@gmail.com)
Kepada: suryati_luh@yahoo.com
Tanggal: Selasa, 31 Januari 2023 pukul 23.21 GMT+8

Dear Luh Suriati

Thanks for submitting your article for publication. Your manuscript has been formatted and it is ready for
publication. The galley proof is attached to this email for your proofreading. Please read your manuscript
carefully and respond to the questions below within 72 hours so that we may publish your manuscript
ASAP.

Regards;

Muhammad Umair

Journal Manager
Academic E‘&ﬁﬂ

Academic Research Publishing Group

URL: www.arpgweb.com

Pakistan Office: Rahim Yar Khan, 64200 Punjab, Pakistan
Germany Office: 47 Kasselbergweg 63619 Bad Orb, Germany
Email: editor@arpgweb.com ; info@arpgweb.com

Phone: +92685870320

On Fri, Jan 27, 2023 at 8:52 PM luh suriati <suryati luh@yahoo.com> wrote:

Thank you

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone

On Friday, January 27, 2023, 9:37 PM, Status ARPG <statusarpg@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Luh Suriati
Thank you for your email. Please note that within 48 hours the galley proof will be sent to you.

Regards;

Muhammad Umair
Journal Manager
Academic Research
P T

i

Academic Research Publishing Group

URL: www.arpgweb.com

Pakistan Office: Rahim Yar Khan, 64200 Punjab, Pakistan
Germany Office: 47 Kasselbergweg 63619 Bad Orb, Germany
Email: editor@arpgweb.com ; info@arpgweb.com

Phone: +92685870320
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On Fri, Jan 27, 2023 at 2:21 PM luh suriati <suryati_luh@yahoo.com> wrote:
Dear Editor

| hope you are well

I would like to ask about my manuscript already accepted that the tittle is "The impact of chitosan at the
physical performance of the coffee skin-based edible film". Would you give me the progress?

Thank you

Best regards

Luh Suriati
Pada Selasa, 3 Januari 2023 21.41.07 GMT+8, Status ARPG <statusarpg@gmail.com> menulis:

Dear Luh Suriati

Thank you for your revised file and the publication fee. Your manuscript is now in the proofreading and
formatting process for publication. Within 18 Days (Maybe earlier) our publication dept. will contact you.

Regards,

Muhammad Umair
Journal Manager

Academic Research

P T, CROu

Academic Research Publishing Group

URL: www.arpgweb.com

Pakistan Office: Rahim Yar Khan, 64200 Punjab, Pakistan
Germany Office: 47 Kasselbergweg 63619 Bad Orb, Germany
Email: editor@arpgweb.com ; info@arpgweb.com

Phone: +92685870320

On Sun, Jan 1, 2023 at 7:16 PM luh suriati <suryati_luh@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Editors

| sent back the revised manuscript according to the reviewer's suggestion.
Red writing as a marker indicating the part that has been repaired.

And also i already paid the fee as you can see in the attachment receipt below
| hope to publish as soon as possible in your journal.

Thank You

Best regards

Luh Suriati

Pada Minggu, 1 Januari 2023 01.12.13 GMT+8, Status ARPG <status@arpgweb.com> menulis:

Paper ID: 44456-JAC-2022

Paper Title: The impact of chitosan at the physical performance of the coffee skin-based edible film
Journal: Journal of Agriculture and Crops

Dear Luh Suriati
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Happy New Year!

We are pleased to inform you that your manuscript has been conditionally accepted for publication in
the Journal of Agriculture and Crops. The manuscript was evaluated and reviewed by two referees.
According to the review report you need to make a minor correction in the manuscript. Revise your
manuscript according to the review report and submit it again. Below is attached the review report for
your assistance.

Please pay online + one hard copy publication fee of USD 600 and send the scanned copy of the
payment receipt for the publication process.

If you don’t want to have the hard copy then please pay only an online publication fee of USD 500.

You are requested to complete the payment formalities within 2 working days so that your article can be
accommodated in the latest issue of the journal. We recommend electronic fund transfer to avoid postal
delay in receiving the article publication fees at the editorial office.

Please remember to quote your paper ID in all future correspondence.

Click here for payment details. Your invoice is attached below.

Note: Please make all corrections and modifications highlighted to crosscheck easily. Thanks

Regards;

Muhammad Umair
Journal Manager
Academie i&g&ﬂ
Academic Research Publishing Group
URL: www.arpgweb.com
Pakistan Office: Rahim Yar Khan, 64200 Punjab, Pakistan
Germany Office: 47 Kasselbergweg 63619 Bad Orb, Germany
Email: editor@arpgweb.com ; info@arpgweb.com
Phone: +92685870320
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Re: 44456-JAC-023 Dear Luh Suriati

Dari: Status ARPG (statusarpg@gmail.com)
Kepada: suryati_luh@yahoo.com
Tanggal: Rabu, 15 Februari 2023 pukul 02.58 GMT+8

Dear Luh Suriati
Greetings!
Your paper has been published.

Available at: https://arpgweb.com/journal/14/archive/04-2023/2/9

Thanks for publishing with us. We would warmly welcome to hear from you about your experience of publication with us.
It will be helpful for us to improve our services.

Regards
Muhammad Umair
Journal Manager

Academic Research
R TL RO

Academic Research Publishing Group

URL: www.arpgweb.com

Pakistan Office: Rahim Yar Khan, 64200 Punjab, Pakistan
Germany Office: 47 Kasselbergweg 63619 Bad Orb, Germany
Email: editor@arpgweb.com ; info@arpgweb.com

Phone: +92685870320

On Tue, Feb 14, 2023 at 10:57 PM Journal Manager <proofreadarpg@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Luh Suriati

Greetings!
Your paper has been published.

Available at: https://arpgweb.com/journal/14/archive/04-2023/2/9

Thanks for publishing with us. We would warmly welcome to hear from you about your experience of publication
with us. It will be helpful for us to improve our services.

Best Regards;
Muhammad Raza Ullah

Journal Manager

Academic Research Publishing Group

Address; Rahim Yar Khan - 64200, Punjab, Pakistan

URL: www.arpgweb.com

For more information Email: editor@arpgweb.com ; info@arpgweb.com

On Tue, Feb 14, 2023 at 6:57 AM luh suriati <suryati_luh@yahoo.com> wrote:
Dear Editor
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Could you give me the information about my manuscript that will be publish?
thank you
best regards

Pada Jumat, 3 Februari 2023 20.22.47 GMT+8, Journal Manager <proofreadarpg@gmail.com> menulis:

Dear Luh Suriati

Noted with thanks. Your paper will be published within ten working days.

Best Regards;
Muhammad Raza Ullah

Journal Manager

Academic Research Publishing Group

Address; Rahim Yar Khan - 64200, Punjab, Pakistan

URL: www.arpgweb.com

For more information Email: editor@arpgweb.com ; info@arpgweb.com

On Wed, Feb 1, 2023 at 1:20 PM luh suriati <suryati_luh@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Editor

| am already read and revise the manuscrpt. | send back the manuscript as attachment and ready to
publish.

thank you very much.

Best regards

Pada Selasa, 31 Januari 2023 23.13.25 GMT+8, Journal Manager <proofreadarpg@gmail.com> menulis:

Dear Luh Suriati

Thanks for submitting your article for publication. Your manuscript has been formatted and it
is ready for publication. The galley proof is attached to this email for your proofreading. Please
read your manuscript carefully and respond to the questions below within 72 hours so that we
may publish your manuscript ASAP.

Best Regards;
Muhammad Raza Ullah

Journal Manager

Academic Research Publishing Group

Address; Rahim Yar Khan - 64200, Punjab, Pakistan

URL: www.arpgweb.com

For more information Email: editor@arpgweb.com ; info@arpgweb.com



mailto:proofreadarpg@gmail.com
http://www.arpgweb.com/
mailto:editor@arpgweb.com
mailto:info@arpgweb.com
mailto:suryati_luh@yahoo.com
mailto:proofreadarpg@gmail.com
http://www.arpgweb.com/
mailto:editor@arpgweb.com
mailto:info@arpgweb.com

